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1. Bukti Submit Artikel
24 Agustus 2021
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SUBMISSION NEW ARTICLE
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2021.

esti susanti (susantiesti@yahoo.com)
editorijsbar2@gssrr.org
Tuesday, August 24, 2021 at 10:55 AM GMT+7

editor

I present my research article in the hope that it will be published in the August
edition of IJSBAR.
submitting this article for the second time. My first delivery was on August 20,

I'm waiting for a response from the editorial team.
Thank you for the opportunity you gave me.
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regards,

Christina Esti Susanti

)
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2. Bukti Penerimaan Artikel
25 Agustus 2021



1/14/26, 2:05 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: SUBMISSION NEW ARTICLE

Re: SUBMISSION NEW ARTICLE

From: Mohammad Nassar (editorijsbar2@gssrr.org)
To:  susantiesti@yahoo.com

Date: Wednesday, August 25, 2021 at 01:45 AM GMT+7

Dear Author;
it was received before and it is under review. it will need another 8-12 days to send you results.
The Journal have two peer review options:

A- Ordinary peer review process: Expected time is 13 - 20 days. (The cost for ordinary peer review process is (105
USD) paid only if the paperis accepted).

B- Fast track peer review process: the peer review results are guaranteed to be available within 2-4 days. Cost:
add 35 USD to the cost of the ordinary process: total cost (140 USD) paid only if the paperis accepted.

With Best Regards.

Principal Contact

Editor in Chief

Dr. Mohamad Nassar

International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR)
Email: editorijsbar2@gssrr.org

Phone: mobile: 00962788780593

UNSUBSCRIBE INSTRUCTIONS:

Unsubscribe from all International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR) e-mails; if you do not wish
to receive emails from us, please replay to this message with “unsubscribe”. Please allow up to two days for the complete
unsubscribe process to take place.

From: esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 24, 2021 6:55 AM

To: Mohammad Nassar <editorijsbar2@gssrr.org>
Subject: SUBMISSION NEW ARTICLE

Dear editor

Here I present my research article in the hope that it will be published in the
August 2021 edition of IJSBAR.

I am submitting this article for the second time. My first delivery was on August
20, 2021.

I'm waiting for a response from the editorial team.

Thank you for the opportunity you gave me.

Best regards, )
Christina Esti Susanti
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3. Bukti Review Substansi
14 September 2021



1/14/26, 2:06 PM Yahoo Mail - Fw d: [JSBAR] Editor Decision: Accept the Paper: THE EFFECT of HEdPERF (HIGH EDUCATION PERFORMANCE) on C...

Fwd: [IJSBAR] Editor Decision: Accept the Paper: THE EFFECT of HEdPERF (HIGH
EDUCATION PERFORMANCE) on COGNITIVE OUTCOMES THROUGH QUALITY of STUDENT
EXPERIENCE in HIGHER EDUCATION INSTITUTIONS ACCREDITED (AIPT) A in EAST JAVA

From: Dr. Christina Esti Susanti, S.E., M.M., CPMAP (esti@ukwms.ac.id)
To:  susantiesti@yahoo.com

Date: Tuesday, September 14, 2021 at 12:26 PM GMT+7

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Mohammad Nassar <editorijsbar2@gssrr.org>

Date: Thu, Sep 2, 2021 at 9:34 PM

Subject: [IUSBAR] Editor Decision: Accept the Paper: THE EFFECT of HEAPERF (HIGH EDUCATION
PERFORMANCE) on COGNITIVE OUTCOMES THROUGH QUALITY of STUDENT EXPERIENCE in HIGHER
EDUCATION INSTITUTIONS ACCREDITED (AIPT) A in EAST JAVA

To: Dr. Christina Esti Susanti, S.E., M.M., CPMAP <esti@ukwms.ac.id>

Dear Author:

We have reached a decision regarding your submission to International Journal of Sciences: Basic and
Applied Research (IJSBAR).

Our decision is to: Accept the paper.

Please read the details within the attachment carefully.

With Best Regards.

Principal Contact

Editor in Chief

Dr. Mohammad Nassar

International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR)
Email: editorijsbar2@gssrr.org

Phone: mobile: 00962788780593

UNSUBSCRIBE INSTRUCTIONS:

Unsubscribe from all International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR) e-mails; if you do not wish
to receive emails from us, please replay to this message with “unsubscribe”. Please allow up to two days for the complete
unsubscribe process to take place.
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- 439.1 kB
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4. Bukti Hasil Revisi
14 September 2021
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ARTICLE, COPYRIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA
ESTI SUSANTI

From: esti susanti (susantiesti@yahoo.com)
To:  editorijsbar2@gssrr.org
Date: Tuesday, September 14, 2021 at 03:44 PM GMT+7

Dear editor

I submit the following:

1. Revision of research articles

2. Copyright form

3. Proof of payment

on behalf of Christina Esti Susanti with Manuscript Number 13121.
Thank you

Best regards, )
Christina Esti Susanti

@ REVISED - HERDPERF - CHRISTINA ESTI SSUSANTI.doc
206.5 kB

[JSBAR Copyright form - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI.doc

@ 551.5 kB
A

PROOF OF PAYMENT - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI - ID 13121.pdf
2 MB

about:blank

17



5. Bukti Review Pembayaran
16 September 2021



1/14/26, 2:08 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: ARTICLE, COPY RIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

Re: ARTICLE, COPYRIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA
ESTI SUSANTI

From: Mohammad Nassar (editorijsbar2@gssrr.org)
To:  susantiesti@yahoo.com

Date: Thursday, September 16, 2021 at 04:02 AM GMT+7

Dear Author;

A- the receiver name is not correct in the transfer; it must be a company not a person mohammad othmna nassar;
the correctis “Mohammad Nassar for Researches”

B- From what we see within the transfer document; it has the following missing information that may
result in rejecting the transfer by our bank:
1- Payment Purpose Code is (0803: Information Technology Services)

C- Itis strongly recommended that you contact your bank to make sure that they add that information to
the transfer information by sending an amendment (SWIFT amendment) that contains the mentioned
information. otherwise, the transfer will be rejected from our bank.

With Best Regards.

Principal Contact

Editor in Chief

Dr. Mohamad Nassar

International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR)
Email: editorijsbar2@gssrr.org

Phone: mobile: 00962788780593

UNSUBSCRIBE INSTRUCTIONS:

Unsubscribe from all International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR) e-mails; if you do not wish
to receive emails from us, please replay to this message with “unsubscribe”. Please allow up to two days for the complete
unsubscribe process to take place.

From: esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 14, 2021 11:44 AM

To: Mohammad Nassar <editorijshar2@gssrr.org>

Subject: ARTICLE, COPYRIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

Dear editor )
I submit the following: ]
1. Revision of research articles
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1/14/26, 2:08 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: ARTICLE, COPY RIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

2. Copyright form

3. Proof of payment

on behalf of Christina Esti Susanti with Manuscript Number 13121.
Thank you

Best regards, )
Christina Esti Susanti

about:blank 2/2



6. Bukti Revisi Pembayaran
18 September 2021



1/14/26, 2:09 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: ARTICLE, COPY RIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

Re: ARTICLE, COPYRIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA
ESTI SUSANTI

From: esti susanti (susantiesti@yahoo.com)
To:  editorijsbar2@gssrr.org
Date: Saturday, September 18, 2021 at 09:28 PM GMT+7

Dear Dr. Mohammad Nassar
Here I convey the revisions that I have made as informed.
Thank you.

Best regards, )
Christina Esti Susanti

On Thursday, 16 September 2021, 04:02:18 am GMT+7, Mohammad Nassar <editorijsbar2@gssrr.org> wrote:

Dear Author;

A- the receiver name is not correct in the transfer; it must be a company not a person mohammad othmna
nassar; the correctis “Mohammad Nassar for Researches”

B- From what we see within the transfer document; it has the following missing information that may
result in rejecting the transfer by our bank:
1- Payment Purpose Code is (0803: Information Technology Services)

C- It is strongly recommended that you contact your bank to make sure that they add that information
to the transfer information by sending an amendment (SWIFT amendment) that contains the mentioned
information. otherwise, the transfer will be rejected from our bank.

With Best Regards.

Principal Contact

Editor in Chief

Dr. Mohamad Nassar

International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR)
Email: editorijsbar2@gssrr.org

Phone: mobile: 00962788780593

UNSUBSCRIBE INSTRUCTIONS:

Unsubscribe from all International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR) e-mails; if you do not
wish to receive emails from us, please replay to this message with “unsubscribe”. Please allow up to two days for the
complete unsubscribe process to take place.
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1/14/26, 2:09 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: ARTICLE, COPY RIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

From: esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 14, 2021 11:44 AM

To: Mohammad Nassar <editorijsbar2@gssrr.org>

Subject: ARTICLE, COPYRIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

Dear editor

I submit the following:

1. Revision of research articles

2. Copyright form

3. Proof of payment

on behalf of Christina Esti Susanti with Manuscript Number 13121.
Thank you

Best regards, )
Christina Esti Susanti

’_Lj REVISED - PROOF OF PAYMENT - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI.pdf
1.4 MB
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7. Bukti Review Sitasi
24 September 2021



1/14/26, 2:12 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: ARTICLE, COPY RIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

Re: ARTICLE, COPYRIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA
ESTI SUSANTI

From: Mohammad Nassar (editorijsbar2@gssrr.org)
To:  susantiesti@yahoo.com

Date: Friday, September 24, 2021 at 05:57 PM GMT+7

Dear Author;

Your paper needs modification regarding references citation within the paper; kindly correct then
return based on the following note:

References citation within the paper need to be reformatted exactly according to the IEEE style (more details can
be found in the template; template can be downloaded from the journal site). The author name and year for citation
should be removed. The reference number from the references list at the end of the author paper (the references at
the end of the paper should be numbered) should be used instead. Example on the correct citation “The authors in
[2,3] noted that crushed aggregates having angular to sub-angular shaped”. Example on the wrong citation “
(nassar,2013) and (Fokianos et al., 2007) noted that crushed aggregates having angular to sub-angular shaped”
(nassar,2013).

With Best Regards.

Principal Contact

Editor in Chief

Dr. Mohamad Nassar

International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR)
Email: editorijsbar2@gssrr.org

Phone: mobile: 00962788780593

UNSUBSCRIBE INSTRUCTIONS:

Unsubscribe from all International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR) e-mails; if you do not wish
to receive emails from us, please replay to this message with “unsubscribe”. Please allow up to two days for the complete
unsubscribe process to take place.

From: esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com>

Sent: Monday, September 20, 2021 5:15 AM

To: Mohammad Nassar <editorijsbar2@gssrr.org>

Subject: Re: ARTICLE, COPYRIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

Dear

Principal Contact
Editor in Chief

Dr. Mohamad Nassar

about:blank 1/4



1/14/26, 2:12 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: ARTICLE, COPY RIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR)

Please be willing to correct again. I've made the revisions as requested.
1. must be a company not a person

Non-resident

2. receiver name to be "“Mohammad Nassar for Researches”
Mohammad Nassar for Researches

3. Payment Purpose Code is (0803: Information Technology Services)
0803 Information Technology Services

Thank you very much.

Best regards,
Christina Esti Susanti

On Sunday, 19 September 2021, 10:52:05 pm GMT+7, Mohammad Nassar <editorijsbar2@gssrr.org> wrote:

Dear Author;

the official amendment printed document shows that they order to add 803 as code which is correct.
the official amendment printed document shows no change requested to receiver name to be "“Mohammad
Nassar for Researches”". kindly check with your bank since i think they just send the 803 code without
changing the receiver name. i did see the form that you fill and see that you did add the name but i
think your bank did not notice that they must also send the receiver's name correctly.

With Best Regards.

Principal Contact

Editor in Chief

Dr. Mohamad Nassar

International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR)
Email: editorijsbar2@gssrr.org

Phone: mobile: 00962788780593

UNSUBSCRIBE INSTRUCTIONS:

Unsubscribe from all International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR) e-mails; if you do not
wish to receive emails from us, please replay to this message with “unsubscribe”. Please allow up to two days for the
complete unsubscribe process to take place.

From: esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com>

Sent: Saturday, September 18, 2021 5:28 PM

To: Mohammad Nassar <editorijsbar2@gssrr.org>

Subject: Re: ARTICLE, COPYRIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

Dear Dr. Mohammad Nassar

Here I convey the revisions that I have made as informed.
Thank you.
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1/14/26, 2:12 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: ARTICLE, COPY RIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

Best regards, )
Christina Esti Susanti

On Thursday, 16 September 2021, 04:02:18 am GMT+7, Mohammad Nassar <editorijsbar2@gssrr.org> wrote:

Dear Author;

A- the receiver name is not correct in the transfer; it must be a company not a person mohammad othmna
nassar; the correctis  “Mohammad Nassar for Researches”

B- From what we see within the transfer document; it has the following missing information that may
result in rejecting the transfer by our bank:
1- Payment Purpose Code is (0803: Information Technology Services)

C- It is strongly recommended that you contact your bank to make sure that they add that information
to the transfer information by sending an amendment (SWIFT amendment) that contains the mentioned
information. otherwise, the transfer will be rejected from our bank.

With Best Regards.

Principal Contact

Editor in Chief

Dr. Mohamad Nassar

International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR)
Email: editorijsbar2@gssrr.org

Phone: mobile: 00962788780593

UNSUBSCRIBE INSTRUCTIONS:

Unsubscribe from all International Journal of Sciences: Basic and A pplied Research (IJSBAR) e-mails; if you do not
wish to receive emails from us, please replay to this message with “unsubscribe”. Please allow up to two days for the
complete unsubscribe process to take place.

From: esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 14, 2021 11:44 AM

To: Mohammad Nassar <editorijsbar2@gssrr.org>

Subject: ARTICLE, COPYRIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

Dear editor

I submit the following:

1. Revision of research articles

2. Copyright form

3. Proof of payment

on behalf of Christina Esti Susanti with Manuscript Number 13121.
Thank you

about:blank 3/4



1/14/26, 2:12 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: ARTICLE, COPY RIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

Best regards, )
Christina Esti Susanti
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8. Bukti Revisi Final
26 September 2021



1/14/26, 2:13 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: ARTICLE, COPY RIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

Re: ARTICLE, COPYRIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA
ESTI SUSANTI

From: esti susanti (susantiesti@yahoo.com)
To:  editorijsbar2@gssrr.org
Date: Sunday, September 26, 2021 at 01:00 PM GMT+7

Dear Mohammad Nassar ] )
Here I submit the revision as given the 1input.
thank you

Best regards, )
Christina Esti Susanti

On Friday, 24 September 2021, 05:57:48 pm GMT+7, Mohammad Nassar <editorijsbar2@gssrr.org> wrote:

Dear Author;

Your paper needs modification regarding references citation within the paper; kindly correct then
return based on the following note:

References citation within the paper need to be reformatted exactly according to the IEEE style (more details
can be found i the template; template can be downloaded from the journal site). The author name and year for
citation should be removed. The reference number from the references list at the end of the author paper (the
references at the end of the paper should be numbered) should be used instead. Example on the correct citation
“The authors in [2,3] noted that crushed aggregates having angular to sub-angular shaped”. Example on the
wrong citation “ (nassar,2013) and (Fokianos et al., 2007) noted that crushed aggregates having angular to sub-
angular shaped” (nassar,2013).

With Best Regards.

Principal Contact

Editor in Chief

Dr. Mohamad Nassar

International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR)
Email: editorijsbar2@gssrr.org

Phone: mobile: 00962788780593

UNSUBSCRIBE INSTRUCTIONS:

Unsubscribe from all International Journal of Sciences: Basic and A pplied Research (IJSBAR) e-mails; if you do not
wish to receive emails from us, please replay to this message with “unsubscribe”. Please allow up to two days for the
complete unsubscribe process to take place.

about:blank 1/4



1/14/26, 2:13 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: ARTICLE, COPY RIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

From: esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com>

Sent: Monday, September 20, 2021 5:15 AM

To: Mohammad Nassar <editorijsbar2@gssrr.org>

Subject: Re: ARTICLE, COPYRIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

Dear

Principal Contact

Editor n Chief

Dr. Mohamad Nassar

International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR)

Please be willing to correct again. I've made the revisions as requested.
1. must be a company not a person

Non-resident

2. receiver name to be "“Mohammad Nassar for Researches”
Mohammad Nassar for Researches

3. Payment Purpose Code is (0803: Information Technology Services)
0803 Information Technology Services

Thank you very much.

Best regards,
Christina Esti Susanti

On Sunday, 19 September 2021, 10:52:05 pm GMT+7, Mohammad Nassar <editorijsbar2@gssrr.org> wrote:

Dear Author;

the official amendment printed document shows that they order to add 803 as code which is correct.
the official amendment printed document shows no change requested to receiver name to be "“Mohammad
Nassar for Researches”". kindly check with your bank since i think they just send the 803 code without
changing the receiver name. i did see the form that you fill and see that you did add the name but i
think your bank did not notice that they must also send the receiver's name correctly.

With Best Regards.

Principal Contact

Editor in Chief

Dr. Mohamad Nassar

International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR)
Email: editorijsbar2@gssrr.org

Phone: mobile: 00962788780593

UNSUBSCRIBE INSTRUCTIONS:

Unsubscribe from all International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR) e-mails; if you do not
wish to receive emails from us, please replay to this message with “unsubscribe”. Please allow up to two days for the
complete unsubscribe process to take place.

about:blank 2/4



1/14/26, 2:13 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: ARTICLE, COPY RIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

From: esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com>

Sent: Saturday, September 18, 2021 5:28 PM

To: Mohammad Nassar <editorijshar2@gssrr.org>

Subject: Re: ARTICLE, COPYRIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

Dear Dr. Mohammad Nassar
Here I convey the revisions that I have made as informed.
Thank you.

Best regards, )
Christina Esti Susanti

On Thursday, 16 September 2021, 04:02:18 am GMT+7, Mohammad Nassar <editorijsbar2@gssrr.org> wrote:

Dear Author;

A- the receiver name is not correct in the transfer; it must be a company not a person mohammad othmna
nassar; the correctis  “Mohammad Nassar for Researches”

B- From what we see within the transfer document; it has the following missing information that may
result in rejecting the transfer by our bank:
1- Payment Purpose Code is (0803: Information Technology Services)

C- It is strongly recommended that you contact your bank to make sure that they add that information
to the transfer information by sending an amendment (SWIFT amendment) that contains the mentioned
information. otherwise, the transfer will be rejected from our bank.

With Best Regards.

Principal Contact

Editor in Chief

Dr. Mohamad Nassar

International Journal of Sciences: Basic and Applied Research (IJSBAR)
Email: editorijsbar2@gssrr.org

Phone: mobile: 00962788780593

UNSUBSCRIBE INSTRUCTIONS:

Unsubscribe from all International Journal of Sciences: Basic and A pplied Research (IJSBAR) e-mails; if you do not
wish to receive emails from us, please replay to this message with “unsubscribe”. Please allow up to two days for the
complete unsubscribe process to take place.

about:blank 3/4



1/14/26, 2:13 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: ARTICLE, COPY RIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

From: esti susanti <susantiesti@yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 14, 2021 11:44 AM

To: Mohammad Nassar <editorijsbar2@gssrr.org>

Subject: ARTICLE, COPYRIGHT FORM, AND PROOF OF PAYMENT - ID CODE 13121 - CHRISTINA ESTI SUSANTI

Dear editor

I submit the following:

1. Revision of research articles

2. Copyright form

3. Proof of payment

on behalf of Christina Esti Susanti with Manuscript Number 13121.
Thank you

Best regards, )
Christina Esti Susanti
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k5 199.5 kB
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